City of Warner Robins
City Council Meeting
Minutes

Monday, April 15, 2019 5:30 PM Council Chamber Room

Regular Meeting of the Warner Robins City Council
Presiding: Mayor Randy Toms

City Officials Present:

Councilwoman Carolyn Robbins Councilman Larry Curtis
Councilman Clifford Holmes Councilman Keith Lauritsen
Councilman Daron Lee Councilman Tim Thomas

Opening Prayer: Councilman Holmes
Pledge of Allegiance: Councilman Lee

Call to Order: 5:32pm

Adoption of the Agenda: Councilman Holmes moved to adopt the agenda with the deletion of Action
Item Number 10. Rezoning Petition — Case Cajco, 5.8 acres on Russell Pkwy C-2 [General Commercial
District] to R-4 [Multi-Family Residential District]. Councilman Lauritsen seconded the motion.
Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas voted for adoption of

the agenda.

Proclamations, Awards and Presentations:

¢ Mayor Toms read a proclamation proclaiming the week of April 15— 19, 2019 as Supermarket of
Veterans Benefits Day.

e Mayor Toms presented Employee Service Awards to the following employees for their loyal and
dedicated service to the City: Jason Bond/Information Technology for 5 years of service; Aubrey
Williams/Police Department for 5 years of service; David Ingle/Police Department for 5 years of
service; Jennifer Mann/Police Department for 5 years of service; Brian White/Fire Department
for 10 years of service; James Nix/Fire Department for 10 years of service; Joey
McDuffie/Utilities for 25 years of service; Gregory Langston/Police Department for 30 years of
service; Joel Lord /Fire Department for 30 years of service; and Timothy Boone/Fire Department
for 30 years of service.

e Rodney Deal with the Municipal Gas Authority updated Mayor and Council on Jointly Owned
Gas.
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City Council Meeting Minutes April 15, 2019

Action ltem 1 Presentation of Minutes

The minutes of the last regular meeting of April 1, 2019 were presented for approval.

S Councilman Lee moved to approve the minutes of the regular meeting of April 1,
Motion:
2019.
Second: Councilman Lauritsen.
Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas
QOutcome: ;
voted for approval of the minutes.

Action ltem 2 Purchasing Bids

Purchasing Bid List items, attached hereto, were presented for approval.

: Councilman Holmes presented and moved to approve the bid list items one
Motion:
through ten.
Second: Councilman Curtis.
Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas
Outcome: R
voted for approval of the bid list.

Action Item 3 Appointment of Acting Police Chief

A motion was made to appoint John Wagner as Acting Police Chief.

Motion: Councilman Lauritsen moved to approve the motion.

Second: Councilman Thomas.

Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas

Outcome:
voted for approval.
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Action Item 4 Ordinance - Budget Transfer Storm Water Drainage/The Walk at Sandy Run

Ordinance #06-19 of Mayor and Council of the City of Warner Robins authorizing that $63,000.00 be taken from
the Unrestricted Net Assets of the Storm Water Drainage Utility Fund and transferred to a line item account to
cover soil stabilization site work at The Walk at Sandy Run. These funds shall be placed in, account number
61.00.04320.54063, New Projects...

: Councilman Thomas presented the second reading of this Ordinance
Motion:
#06-19.
Second: Councilman Holmes
Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas
Outcome:
voted for approval.

Action Item 5 Annexation — Thomas Mason/3.44 acres/ Ely Place and West Wrasling Way

Ordinance #07-19 of the Mayor and Council of the City of Warner Robins, annexing Land Lot 164 of the 10th
Land District of Houston County, Georgia, and being known and designated as Parcel “A-1”, comprising 3.44
acres, and having such shapes, metes, bounds, courses and distances as are shown on a plat of survey for
Mason Financial Services, LLC, prepared by Robert L. Story, Georgia Registered Land Surveyor No. 1853, dated
January 21, 2019 and recorded in Plat Book 80, Page 264, Clerk’s Office, Houston Superior Court. Said plat of
survey and the recorded copy thereof are hereby made a part of this description by reference thereto. The
property is located at Ely Place and West Wrasling Way, a zoning request for same property of R-4 [Multi-Family
Residential] [City].

Motioh: Councilman Lee moved for the adoption of Ordinance #07-19, moved to waive the
; second reading of Ordinance #07-18 and moved for approval of Ordinance #07-18.
Second: Councilman Holmes.
Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas
Outcome:
voted for approval.
7 Councilman Lee moved to approve the zoning request of R-4 [Multi Family
Motion: . \ :
Residential] [City].
Second: Councilwoman Robbins.
: Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas
Outcome:
voted for approval.
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Resolution — 2001 Special Purpose Local Option Sales Tax (SPLOST)/Wall Street Extension

Action Item : i
& mo and Martin Luther King Blvd

A Resolution of Mayor and Council of the City of Warner Robins amending a resolution adopted on May 7, 2001
which approved a list of roadway projects to be funded with the City’s proceeds from the 2001 Houston County
Special Purpose Local Option Sales Tax (SPLOST); to provide that the remaining $411,424.00 of the City’s 2001
Houston County SPLOST funds be redirected from the “Wall Street Extension” and “Martin Luther King, Jr.
Boulevard” projects to the City’s 2019 Local Maintenance & Improvement Grant (LMIG) program for the
resurfacing of rights-of-way in the Warner Robins municipal street system.

Motion: Councilman Holmes moved to approve the Resolution.

Second: Councilman Thomas.

Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas

Outcome:
voted for approval.

Resolution — Governor’s Office of Highway Safety Grant Application/Houston County Family

Action Item 7 7
Connection, Inc.

A Resolution of the Mayor and Council of the City of Warner Robins authorizing Mayor Randy Toms to execute a
grant award agreement to be filed in conjunction with the said application.

Motion: Councilman Lauritsen presented this resolution and moved for its approval.

Second: Councilman Lee

Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas

Outcome:
voted for approval.

Action Item 8 Resolution — Middle Georgia Clean Air Coalition

A Resolution of the Mayor and Council of the City of Warner Robins authorizing a contribution to the Middle
Georgia Clean Air Coalition as budgeted for in FY 2019 in the amount of sixteen thousand six hundred forty-
seven dollars ($16,647).

Motion: Councilman Holmes moved to approve the Resolution.

Second: Councilman Curtis.
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Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas

Outcome: voted for approval.

Action Item 9 Petition - Rezoning — WB Real Estate Group/4000 Russell Pkwy

WB Real Estate Group requested rezoning of 4000 Russell Pkwy totaling 1.00 acres from the zoning of C-1
[Neighborhood Commercial District] to C-2 [General Commercial District]. The Planning and Zoning Commission
approved this request and forwarded its recommendation to the Mayor and Council of the City of Warner Robins
for final approval.

Motion: Councilman Lee moved to approve the Petition to Rezone.

Second: Councilman Lauritsen.

Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas

Outcome:
voted for approval.

Action Item 10 Animal Limitation Waiver — Deborah Byrd/302 Sarah Drive

Deborah Byrd applied for an Animal Limitation Waiver with the City of Warner Robins. The applicant seeks
permission to house a maximum of five (5) dogs at her residence 302 Sarah Dr., Warner Robins GA 31093. The
applicant states that two of the dogs belong to her brother who is helping her through medical issues.

Outcome: Councilman Thomas moved to deny the request.

Second: Councilman Holmes.

Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas

utcome: :
0 voted for denial.

Action Item 11 Home Occupation Approvals

The following Home Occupation Permits are recommended for approval by the Planning and Zoning Board:

o  William A. King — 108 Trickum Court — requests permission to operate a HVAC business.

e Anrico Freeman — 208 Erin Way — requests permission to operate a landscaping business.

¢ Shaneka Wade — 121 Margie Drive, Apt. 402 — requests permission to operate an online clothing
sales business.

e Nancy Ivory — 207 Utah Avenue — requests permission to operate a private chef business.

e Nashonna O’Connor — 318 Camellia Circle — requests permission to operate an online beauty supply
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sales business.

e Donald Clark — 108 Berkley Circle — requests permission to operate a landscaping business.

e Donna M. Rogers — 304 Tarrasa Drive — requests permission to operate a legal office business.

e Edward Haslund, Jr. — 351 Somerset Drive — requests permission to operate a flooring installation
business.

e Winston Tyrone Smith — 102 Country Cove — request permission to operate an art sales business.

e Natalie Sauro — 208 Avondale Circle — request permission to operate an online soap sales business.

e Katrina Johnson — 417 Dorothy Court — request permission to operate an event planning business.

Motion: Councilman Lauritsen moved for approval of these Home Occupation Permits

Second: Councilman Lee.

Ottedma: Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas
. voted for approval

Action Item 12 Certified City of Ethics — Discussion Only

Councilman Curtis entertained the idea that Warner Robins look into becoming a “Certified City of Ethics.”

Motion: N/A
Second: N/A
Outcome: M

Action Item 13 Resolution - Raise for City Council

A Resolution of Mayor and Council of the City of Warner Robins directing the city attorney’s office to commence
the statutory process found in Official Code of Georgia Annotated § 36-35-4(a) to increase the salary of city
council members to $10,000.00 per year, amending city code section 2-28(a).

Motion: Councilman Holmes moved to approve the Resolution.

Second: Councilman Lee.

Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes, Lee voted for approval.

Outcome: : i
u Councilman Lauritsen and Thomas opposed.
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Closed Session: During the regular meeting, Mayor Toms requested a motion to enter into an executive
session regarding personnel. Councilman Thomas moved for an executive session to discuss personnel.
Councilman Lauritsen seconded the motion. Councilwoman Robbins, Councilmen Curtis, Holmes,
Lauritsen, Lee, and Thomas voted for approval of the motion. The regular meeting closed at 6:46 pm;
the governing body convened into closed session at 6:55 pm; the closed session ended at 7:05 pm. Jim
Elliott, City Attorney is in possession of closed session minutes.

Citizen Comments: Susan Mullens, Ansel Peck, Lori Curtis, Rita Simon, Alton Mattox, Heather Chin-a-
Young, and David Cooke.

Adjournment: 6:46 p.m.

Next Regular Council Meeting: Monday, May 6, 2019.

it
ity Gler

KE(thy Op
Assistant
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CITY OF WARNER ROBINS, GEORGIA (2 #rrmued. 52015,

COUNCIL DATE: April 15, 2019

WRITTEN REQUESTS HAVE BEEN SUBMITTED BY THE CITY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE FOLLOWING ITEMS. THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT RECOMMENDS THE FOLLOWING
ITEMS BE ACQUIRED. BY APPROVAL, AUTHORITY IS GIVEN FOR SUPPORTING CONTRACTS TO BE EXECUTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH APPLICABLE PROVISIONS OF THE CITY
CODE: (Bid tabulations are attached)

BID NUMBER / ITEMS VENDOR COST H ACCOUNT NO./BUDGET COMMENTS
Work Uniforms Maelstrom Footwear d/b/a $24,645.00 ALL DEPARTMENTS
ANNUAL CONTRACT Unimex Corporation
Sterling, VA See attachments
Bid No.: GG-4201 #la, 1b, lc & 1d 1
2)  WRATS 2045 Long Range RS&H $224,832.00 7220 52021/ $9,500.00 80% Reimbursable from DOT Grant
Transportation Plan Atlanta, GA Remaining Funds
BUILDING & Recommendation of Selection Committee
Bid No.: BT-4186 L TRANSPORTATION —
V| Professional Services
3)  RENEW - Landscape Mntce of | MGTS Lawn Service $5,400.00 Annually | 3260 52139/ $1,200.00 Contract Period:
the LEC Warner Robins, GA Remaining July 1, 2019 - June 30, 2020
ANNUAL CONTRACT $600.00 Monthly
: POLICE - Repairs & Matce by
Bid No.: P-4141 See attachment | Vendors Grounds
#2a;2b & 2c v
Dell PowerEdge R440 Server Shi-Government Solutions $5,151.42 1535 54125/ $16,674.91
Austin, TX Remaining
Bid No.: IT-4205 See attachment #3 | INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY
v/| - Computer Equipment
5)  ASI Modifications to IBM Associated Systems, Inc. $10,275.00 1535 52041/ $32,419.41 January 26, 2019 — February 15, 2019
Software Greenville, SC Remaining
INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY
SOLE SOURCE .\ - Professional Services-Software
& Support




Page —2-

: ACCOUNT NO. :
BID NUMBER / ITEMS VENDOR COST / COMMENTS
BUDGET ,
S R =
6)  Professional Engineering & Constantine Engineering $591,500.00 3101 54063 Task Order 17
Technical Services for the New Fort Walton Beach, FL
Industrial Park Water System UTILITIES / Water — New
Improvements Project PROFESSIONAL SERVICES /| Projects Water Tower
7)  LifePak 1000 AEDs & Accessories | OneBeat CPR Learning $5,652.00 1707 54101/ $13,720.56 3 each
Center, Inc. Remaining
Davie, FL
FRECREATION - Buildings &
.\ Improvements
8)  Westmoreland Gas Lamps & Posts | American Gas Lamp Works £6,120.00 54 54061/ $197,598.53
Springdale, PA Remaining
J UTILITIES / Gas -
Reinforcements
9) Sign Material Traffic Signs, Inc. — Primary $27,274.38 4221 53051/ $784.96 Contract Period:
ANNUAL CONTRACT Jacksonville, AL Remaining May 1, 2019 — April 30, 2020
Osburn Associates - Secondary | $27,260.31 PUBLIC WORKS - Sign Ordered on an as-needed basis throughout
Bid No.: PW-4199 Logan, OH See attachment #4a, |, Material year
4b & 4c¢ v/
10)  Fiber Connect to Municipal eCBI Warner LLC $38,080.00 1401 53100/ POLICE -
Court Atlanta, GA Condemned Funds - State




BID TABULATION

ATTACHMENT: la

Classics Foodservice Mgmt

Ferro Regulus Supply

Unimex Corporation

Feury Image Group Inc.

Total Price

$18,480.60

Total Price

$22,088.90

Total Price

$24,645.00

Total Price

$29,260.10

Line Description

QTY| UOM

Unit

Extended

Unit

Extended

Unit

Extended

Unit

Extended

WORIC SHIRT: Short Sleeve, Red
Kap #5P24 or Equivalent
WORI SHIRT: Long Sleeve, Red
Kap #SP14 or Equivalent
WORK SHIRT: Short Sleeve, Red
Kap #SC40 100% Cotton or
Equivalent
WORIK SHIRT: Long Sleeve, Red
4 Kap #SC30 100% Cotton or
Equivalent
WORIK SHIRT: Short Sleeve, Dickies
#1574
WORK SHIRT: Long Sleeve, Diclkies
#574
WORIK PANT: Uniform style with
7 hook and eye closure, Dickies #874F,
or Equivalent
WORIC PANT: Uniform styles with
g button closure, 100% Cotton, Red
Kap #PC10, or Equivalent

1

N]

=~ CARGO PANT: Relaxed Fit Straight
Leg, Dickies #WP592 or Equivalent
CARGO PANT: Loose Fit Straight

10 Leg, 100% Cotton, Dickies #23214
or Equivalent
WORK JACKET: Quilted lining,

11 panel front, regular & long cut,
Diclkies #7TJ15 or Equivalent

200 Each

200 Each

20 Each

20 Each

200 Each

200

Each

Each

250

Each

50 Each

20 Each

50 Each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$18.56

$19.79

$22.88

No Bid

$24.99

$27.79

$32.99

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
$3,712.00

-$3,958.00

$5,720.00

No Bid

$1,249.50

$555.80

$1,649.50

$11.69

$12.00

$12.64

$13.04

$18.20

$18.20

$18.20

$28.30

$2,338.00

$2.,400.00

$252.80

$260.80
$2,546.00

$2,686.00

$3,042.50

$4,550.00

$910.00

$364.00

$1,415.00

$10.00

$12.50
$11.00

$15.00
$11.00

$14.50
$15.50
$20.00
w:.w.oo
$17.00

$25.00

$2,000.00

$2,500.00

$220.00

$300.00
$2,200.00

$2,900.00

$3,875.00

$5,000.00

$900.00

$340.00

$1,250.00

$12.25

$14.98

$19.20

$18.67

$21.24

$29.85

$2,450.00

$2,996.00

$384.00

$373.40
$3,434.00

$3,628.00

$4,682.50

$5,130.00

$1,061.50

$424.80

$1,492.50
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ATTACHMENT: 1b

12

COVERALL: Brass zipper with

gripper at top and two (2) breast

pockets, Dickies #TV243 or

Equivalent 20 Each
COVERALL: Button front, 100%

Cotton, Red Kap #CC16 or

Equivalent 20 Each

COVERALL: Flame Resistant 100%
Cotton Twill, Red Kap/Bulwark
#JEW2NV or Equivalent 20 Each

$81.79

No Bid

No Bid

$1,635.80

No Bid

No Bid

$19.88

$20.35

$25.96

$397.60

$407.00

$519.20

$65.00

$35.00

$58.00

$1,300.00

$700.00

$1,160.00

$57.58

$34.50

$68.09

$1,151.60

$690.00

$1,361.80
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BID TABULATION

ATTACHMENT: lc

Cannon Companies Brown & Bigelow, Inc Galls, LLC Golden Standard Uniform
Total Price $30,497.00| Total Price| $32,340.70| Total Price| $35,530.00| Total Price $37,404.00
Line Description QTyY _ UOoOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit mxﬁmbn_nm Unit Extended
WORI SHIRT: Short Sleeve, Red :
! Kap #SP24 or Equivalent 200 Each $11.86 $2.372.00 mi 87 $2,974.00 $15.00 mw ooo 00 %Hw 80 mm 560, 00
e ;:o_.a.w e | e s et S50 S ks g i
Kap #SP14 or Equivalent 200 Each $13.11 $2,622.00 fm 87 amw 174.00 Em 50 $3,300.00 $15.30 $3,060. 00
O L o e Rl T e e e B T e SO R A G R R R T
3 Kap #5C40 100% Cotton or : :
Equivalent 20 Each ,f 6.81 $336.20| = $18.89 $377.80 me 00 imo 00 $19.70 mm.fn 00
T WWORK SEART: Long Sleeve ®ed || | TR T T T T
4 Kap #5C30 100% Cotton or
Equivalent - 20 Each ?m 69 @wwo 80 $19. 89 mwou 80 $24, 00 fnmo 00 %ww 00 $440.00
B 0 L e e ) T T e e e B P P e B e o
m e e O e e 200 - TEach ol cBlEeR 0t 3 736:001 - 2Bl 7ia9 T - $3/498.00 $18.00 - $3,600.00|  $23.00 $4,600.00
WORIK SHIRT: Long Sleeve, Dickies | R R
‘m 574 200 Each | = $19.98  $3996.00|  $1849  $3,698.00 $20.00  $4,000.00 1$24.00 $4,800.00
WORIK PANT: Uniform style with B S e e | T e TR et
7 hook and eye closure, Diclies #874F, , : :
= orEqutvalent st 0, o 250 0 Each cf) - 82248 - - $51612.501 -~ $21.36 ~$5.340.00 $19.00  $4,750.00 $25.75- $6,437.50
WORK PANT: Uniform styles with RV E e e TR T T
&  button closure, 100% Cotton, Red ;
Kap #PC10, or Equivalent 250  Each |  $15.61  $3,902.50|  $21.42 $5,355.00 mqm 00  $6,500.00 $25.00 Awo 250.00
9 CARGO PANT: Relaxed Fit Straight . : . :
Leg, Dicldes #WP592 or Equivalent 50 Each $20.61  $1,030.50 $24.37 mH.wHw.mo $37. 00 m: 850.00 $33.75 w.f@ww.mo
et e e L mﬁmumrﬁ 5 S N st | USSR sty e T kbl PG So e R SR e i it O i AL b0, A S S o OO Tl ol i
10 Leg, 100% Cotton, Dicldes #23214 .
or Equivalent 20 Each $29.99 $599.80 $22.16 $443.20 $36.00 $720.00 $32.75 $655.00
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ATTACHMENT: 1d

WORIK JACKET: Quilted lining,
11 panel front, regular & long cut,
Dicldes #TJ15 or Equivalent 50 Eich | $39.99

B30000 I RET0 00 SN0 o 5070

o $1999.50|  $37.32  $1,866.00| - $35.00

COVERALL: Brass zipper with
gripper at top and two (2) breast
pockets, Dickies #1V243 or

LEquivalent 20 Each $81.99 $1,639.80 $67.87 $1,357.40

12

i- %Hmwoowmuoobowm@oo
COVERALL: Button front, 100% PR e S e e s i
* Cotton, Red Kap #CCl16 or ;

Equivalent : 20 Each $35.69 $713.80 $42.11 $842.20

Mo Loisl

| $80000|  $4100. $82000

%4000

COVERALL: Flame Resistant 100%
Cotton Twill, Red IKap/Bulwark
#JEW2NV or Equivalent 20 Each $78.13 $1,562.60 $89.94 $1,798.80 $93.00 $1,860.00 $95.25 $1,905.00

14
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Allison Lanneau

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

All:

Please be advised that MGTS Lawn wishes to renew and continue service on referenced bid No P
for a renewal period of one year. We will hold pricing firm for this period.

Best
Mike -
MGTSLawn

Mike Smith <mike@mgtslawn.com>
Monday, April 08, 2019 8:53 AM
Purchasing_Office

Allison Lanneau

Bid No P-4141 - renewal option

~4141

eC# INFNHOVLLY




BID NO.: P-4141

BID TABULATION

ATTACHMENT #2b
BID OPENING DATE: July 10, 2018
ITEM 2 7 BIDDERS MGTS LAWN CEDARGREEN e PROFESSIONAL
NO.: TUEN, DESTRIE TION: NAME: SERVICE LANDSCAPING SERVICES
QUANTITY UNIT $ [TOoTAL S| UniT $|TOTAL §| UNIT § |TOTAL §| UNIT § | TOTAL §
1 |Landscape Maintenance of LEC 12 Mth $600.00| $7,200.00 $725.00[ $8,700.00 $795.00| $9,540.00|  $1,100.00| $13,200.00
S aa e TOTAL §: $7,200.00 $8,700.00 $9,540.00 $13,200.00
e S ApELVERY: Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly
“ITERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30




BID TABULATION

BID NO.: P-4141 ATTACHMENT #2¢
BID OPENING DATE: July 10, 2018
ITEM BIDDERS TREY'S LAWN
ITEM DESCRIPTION:
NO.: NAME: SERVICE
QUANTITY UNIT $ |TOTAL $| UNIT ¢ |TOTAL $| UNIT $ |TOTAL §$| UNIT § |TOTAL §
1 Landscape Maintenance of LEC 12 Mth $1,564.00| $18,768.00 .
Fea e ToTAL $: $18,768.00
S e S IDELIVERY: Monthly
e s TERMS: Net 30




BID TABULATION

BID NO.: IT-4205 . ATTACHMENT #3
B1D DUE DATE: April 7, 2019
SHI-GOVERNMENT | SOUTHERN COMPUTER
; . ¥e ; BIDDERS NAME: PCMG, INC
ITEM NO.: ITEM DESCRIPTION SOLUTIONS WAREHOUSE
QUANTITY UNIT §$ | TOTAL $| UNIT § | TOTAL $| UNIT $ | TOTAL $| UNIT 4 | TOTAL $
1 Dell PowerEdge R440 Server 1 Each $5,151.42 $5,151.42 $5,488.64 $5,488.64 $5,551.00 $5,551.00
TOTAL §: $5,151.42 $5,488.64 $5,551.00
DELIVERY:
JTERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30




BID TABULATION

ATTACHMENT: 4a

Nippon Carbide Industries Vulcan Inc Osburn Associates Inc Traffic Signs, Inc. Houston Janitorial Supply
Total Price $7.087.50| Total Price] $15,646.92| Total Price] $27,260.31| Total Pricc] $27,274.38] Total Price] $102,282.00

Line Description OMH%_GOZH Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 No Dumping, R10-11, 18 x 24 50 EA NoBid ___ NoBid|  $405  $202.50 $4.08 $204.00 $4.38 $219.00]  $4595  $2,297.50
2 ,Zu.um&m On Red, R10- :w..a x24 50 EA | NoBmid No Bid $4.05 $202.50| $4.08  $20400| = $a38 .mww._ao.o@ 84595  $2,297.50
"3 No Pardng Anytime, R7-1, 12x18 50 EA | NoBid _ NoBid|  $2.03  $101.50|  $2.04  $10200| ~ $219  $109.50|  NoBid ~ NoBid
4 Handicapped, R7-8GA, d.wm..m., T L 50 aEA No Bid No Bid|  $2.03  $101.50|  $2.04  $102.00| $2.19 $109.50|  NoBid No Bid
5 PED Yang, WIIAZ,30x30 30 EA |  NeBid  Nobid  Sed4t #2200 ~ §850 S50  §913  $456%|  NoBid  NoBi
¢ " SED Xing, WI1A-2P, 24 x 18 50 EA No Bid No Bid $4.05 $202.50 $4.08 $204.00 $4.38 $219.00 §56.50  $2,825.00
"% Dead End, W14-1, 24x 24 ~ 50 EA | NoBid . NoBid| 8§540 = $27000| = "$544  $37200|  $5.84  $292.00|  $69.95  $3,459.50
8 Watch For Children, W41-4,24x24 50 EA NoBid  NoBid|  $5.40  $270.00 $5.44  $27200|  $584  $292.00/ NoBid No Bid
9 Chewon, WL, 18x24 50 o Bid NoBid|" ~ 8405 ~ $202.50| ~~ $408  $20400| ~ $438  $21900| ~ $4595 §2,297.50
10 Road Closed, R11-2, 48 x 30 $13.50  $675.00 $13.60 $680.00|  $14.60  $730.00| @..Mm@ 50  $11,975.00
"~ Siop Here On Red (with arrow), wajﬂf e R e e e e e T N
e R R $8.10  $405.00| - $8.16  $408.00 $8.76  $438.00| - $98.75  $4,937.50
12 NoTum OnRed, RI0-11,24x30 50 EA $7.17 $358.50| $6.80  $340.00|  $7.30 $365.00| NoBid No Bid
13 NoTresspassing, 18x24 "~~~ © 50 " EA [~ 1 ) _$405  $202.50f " $408  $204.00 ~ $438°  $219.00|  $4595  $2297.50
14 b, Not Block Intersection, R-10- 7,24x30 50 EA | NoBid No Bid $6.75 $337.50 $6.80 $340.00 $7.30 $365.00 $79.80 $3,990.00
15 Stop, RI-1, 30 x 30 . T 100 EA [T NoBid  NoBid| - $84a . "$82400| -$850 - $850.00/  $9.13 - $91300[ - $55.00 .  $5,900.00
“16 Stop,RI-1,24x24 100 EA |  NoBid  NoBid $5.44  $544.00 $5.44  $544.00  $5.84 $584.00]  $59.00  $5,900.00
“17 Do Not Enter, R5-1,30%30 50 EA |  NoBid __ NoBid| _ $844  Se2.00  $850  $425.00|  $9.13  $45650|  §79.00  _$3,950.00
18 Wrong Way, R5-1A, 30 x 18 50 EA [ 'NoBid NoBid|  $5.06  $253.00|  $5.10  $255.00|  $584  $292.00 $48.00  $2,400.00]
ErETE ?wwwa\.w. B 50 EA |  NoBid .  NoBid|  $068 -~ $34.00[ -~ $0.68 $34.00 $100-. - 95000 77 " $3650 - $IRI500
"20 Speed Limit, R2-1 Blank, 24 x 30 _ 50 EA No Bid No Bid $6.75 $337.50]  $6.80  $340.00|  $7.30  $365.00|  $78.95  $3,947.50
21 Speed Limit, R2-1 Blank, 1§x24 50 EA | ~ NoBid  NoBid|  $4.05 = $90050 . | $& 08 $204.00[  $438  $219.00|  $4595  $2,297.50
o Speed Zone Ahead, R2-5C 50 EA No Bid No Bid|  $4.05 :-.wmmww@ o WO $340.00]  $4.38 $219.00|  $45.95  $2,297.50
Y wmmmm&w.mmma%mmmmHmm.\mw:mmwwm.i‘.ﬁ. 50 EA| NoBid -  -NoBid[. $405 - $20250 = $40 08  $204.00 438 $219.00| $45.95 . $2,297.50
24 Reduced Speed Ahead, R2-5A, 24 x 30 50 EA No Bid No Bid|  $6.75 $337.50|  $6.80  $340.00|  $7.30 E& oo §76885  $3 @mm_. 50
mw Right Lane Must Turn Right, R3-7R, 30x : T e i TR G e R N it e e PR SRR B S R
a0t e S e 50 SRR | T I NoBad - NoBid) 8894 - 8422 00) 0§80 %&Woo ... .59.13 $456.50|  $7885 $3,942.50
__ NoBid  NoBid| $8.44  $422.00 $8.50 $425.00 $9.13  $456.50 $78.85 $3,942.50
~ NoBid NoBid| ~ $6.75 e $6.80  $340.00| ~ $78.85  $3,942.50
28 Keep Right, R4-8, 24 x 30 _ ) _ NoBid  NoBid|  $675  $337.50 $6.80 $340.00| $365.00|  $7885  $3,942.50
29 Keep Right, R4-7A, 18x24 50~ EA | NoBid —  NoBid|  $405 — $302.50{  $408  $20400| _ $438 _ $21900| _ NoBid ____ NoBid
730 One Way, R6-2R, 18 x 24 50 EA No Bid No Bid $4.05 $202.50|  $4.08  $20400| %438  $21900| = $4595  $2,297.50
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31 One Way, R6-2L, 18 x 24 e _$405 " $202.50]  $408  $20400]  $4.38 $219.00 $45.95  $2,297.50
"32 No Dumping, R10-11, 24 x 30 50 g $337.50|  $6.80 $340.00 $7.30  $365.00]  NoBid No Bid
33 School Advance, 51-1,30x30 25 B T O R R T N L T89Ees| T NeBid . NoBid
34 School Crossing, 52-1,30x30 o5 ~$8.44  $211.00]  §15.81 $395.25|  $9.13  $228.25 NoBid  NoBid
35 School, 54-3,24x8 MR R LR $1.80 j45.00] — 3337 geads[ . §2093 0 "§7300|  NoBid - - NoBid
36 School Time, 54-1,24x10 25 $295 &5e03| $420  §10590 $2.92  $73.00) NoBid NoBid
37 Step Ahead, W-1A,30x30 T35 FA ; w7 smys| seso spiasol  s1038  $25950  NoBid  NoBid
38 Step Ahead, W3-1AP, 24 x 18 25 $927 $23175|  .$4.08 ~ $102.00|  $438 ~ $10950|  NoBid _ NoBid
39 Yield Ahead, W3-24, 30 x 30 25 _NoBid|" " '$927 T $23L75| ~ "$8.50 ~$212.50 ~ $10.38 $25050| " $165.00 - $4,12500
40 Yield Ahead, W3-2AP,24x18 25 $4.05  $101.25 $4.08 $102.00 $4.38 $109.50 $45.95  $1,148.75
27 Men Working, W2I-1,30%30  ~ ~ ~ '35 Bid| 8844  $211.00)  $850  $21250) 8913 22825 ~ $78.85 §197125
. Detour, M4-10R, 48 x 18 25 $810  $202.50|  $8.16 $204.00(  $8.76  $219.00| NoBid  NoBid
43 _Detour, M4-10L, 48x18 " 735 T} TR id) 8810  $202.50(  $816  $20400|  "$876  $§219.00| ~NoBid  NoBid
44 YellowBlank, 30x30 WI-B 25 - $8.44  $211.00]  $850  $212.50 $9.13  $228.25 NoBid  NoBid
45 Yellow Blank, 24 x24 WIB 25 No Bid '$540  $135.00|  $5424  $136.00|  $584  $14600| NoBid NoBid
“46 White Blank, 30 x30 R5-B 25 8844 $211.00 $8.50  $212.50 $9.13  $22825| NoBid  NoBid
47 White Blank, 24x24R5-B 35 __NoBid| " '$540 = $135.00| = $544  §I36.00|  $584  $14600| NoBid ___ NoBid
48 Yellow Blank, 18x ISWIB 25 $3.04 $76.00| $3.06  $76.50|  $329  $8225 NoBid No Bid
"49. White Blank, 1§ x18R5B 25 EA | "NoBid _ .. . $3.04 - $7600| ~ 8306 - $76.50|  $329  $8225| NobBid __ NoBid
"50 Alaminum Blanks; STOP, 24 x 24 50 8965  $48250[  $1020  §510.00|  $I1L.71  §585.50|  $69.95  §3,497.50
51 Aluminum Blanks; STOP,30x30 50 id|  $1569  $784.50 $15.94  $797.00|  $1830  $91500/ NoBid _  NoBid
"52  Aluminum Blanks; YIELD, 30" 50 $9.12 $456.00 $9.56  $47800|  $1220  $610.00| NoBid  NoBid
53 Aluminum Blanks; 4 Holes, §x24 10 EA NoBid T %380 " §3800| © 3340 $3400|  $610  $6100 NobBid _ . NoBid
54 Aluminum Blanks; 4 Holes, 10x24 10 E NoBid  NoBid|  $470  §47.00[ imw.-.:iﬁw..wo ~$610  $61.00| NoBid  NoBid
55 E:B_m..am.w.mam. 4Holes, 12x24 10 RS i L NOB e $h 60 BS600) = 3 TTTR51.00] 0 $E10-  §61.00/ 7 NoBid . No Bid
A gl Bid 2 $8320 8915 $91.50/ NoBid  NoBid

57 Aluminum Blanks; 4 Holes, 12x18 1 EA No : %406 T 18458, . §4s8l 1 NoBid . NoBid
58 Aluminum Blanks; 4 Holes, 18 x 18 10 T $63.20| T $6.86 $568.60| T NoBid  NoBid
58 Aluminum Blanks; 4 Floles, 18 x24 10 R g BTN TTTggas T 80150 NoBid. . NoRid
¢ luminum Blanks: 4 Holes, 24 x 24 10 ~ NoBid $11.02  $110.20| 0| $1220  $122.00] WNoBid  NoBid
61 Aluminum Blanks; 4 Holes, 24x30 10 EA~ o Bid o B1%5E O Bas a0 T $1525 " $15250|  NoBid _ NoBid
62  Aluminum Blanks; 4 Holes, Nu.h.ym.....i..“.!.-_..-..H..,. EA Il SLel . SLel $159 .ii% 59| NoBid = NoBid
63 Aluminum Blanks; SCHOOL, 30" 50 EA NoBid ~ $1454 " $727.00 $19.06  $953.00| NoBid  NoBid
s mc,mmﬁ m_mdm m.chQma Qnomﬁ Both mammu ] i 5 L i i i R D
trk High Intensity, 6 x 24 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid mg 50 $165.00 $8.75 $87. 50 No Bid
" Street Signs, Extruded Green Both Sides, [ T T T T e e e = S L T e iR SR

6% High Intensity, 6 x 30. S (I NoBid  NoBid| NoBid . NoBid|  $2063  $20630|  $10.04  $109.40 No Bid
" Street Signs, Extruded Green Both Sides, S S S S e e R Ty A i
66 High Intensity, 6 x 36 y  EA No Bid NoBid| No Bid No Bid $24.75 $2475|  $13.13 $13.13 No Bid
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Street Signs, Extruded Green Both Sides,
67 Highlntensity,6x40 10 EA|  NoBid _  NoBidl NoBid  NoBid| _ $27.50  $27500|  $1531  $153.10| = NoBid No Bid
68 Street Signs, Extruded Green Both Sides, | e o e i i | e i o SO e BRI i
High Intensity, 6 x 42 10 EA No Bid NoBid| NoBid No Bid $28.88 $288.80|  $15.31  $153.10 No Bid No Bid
mqmmﬁ m_.mH)—m mxc.cam&r QHmmHﬂ wog MH.ﬁ—mm I T E kot ac e .. T T e, P e~y P Rt s i e B e R e T 0G: <o i et i e R A e g B N S e T 1 O S B e 3 T o 47 Nl
69 High Intensity, 8 x 24 10 EA | NoBid  NoBid| NoBid  NoBid|  $22.00  $22000 _$1167  $116.70|  NoBid No Bid
m.—.ﬁﬂmﬁ mwmﬁ.mu ﬁéﬁ&ﬁ& O~0P5 HWOHT.MmQﬂm T : j . TolET T [ ‘ S T
70 High Intensity, 8 x 30 10 EA | NoBid  NoBid| NoBid  NoBid|  $27.50  $27500|  $1459  $14590|  NoBid No Bid
T Mc,.ﬂﬂﬁ Mpm.bw.u mxgﬂm& Qﬁmmb WO& mHm—mm CrasE S : = e " : T : R h T oans B [ e o P
7! High Intensity, 8 x 36 S R " NoBid  NoBid| NoBid  NoBid|  $33.00 $33.00]  $17.51 $17.51 No Bid ‘No Bid
Street Signs, Extruded Green Both Sides, ‘ L S PSS e S 1o s R T T e R i
High Intensity, 8 x 40 10 EA No Bid No Bid Zo Bid No Bid $36.67 wwmm 70 $1 9.45 $194.50 No Bid No Bid
Street Signs, Extruded Green Both Sides, e [ e e e T e RO T e s e en | (R aRe co SoRegl e RO S B 0 e e
2 High Intensity, 8 x 42 e S0 BACE S SNSRI Zo‘wa - NoBid  "NoBid $38.50 $385.00 $20.42 $204.20 No Bid No Bid
74 ‘wmmﬁ.wﬂm.mmmpmm@ﬂxww -Locke VC O.% 100 EA T NoBid ~ NoBid| NoBid ~ NoBid| i,.....-ﬁm.mw--...-.wwmw.@.o ~$615  $615.00 ~ NoBid "No Bid
- Street Sign Bracket; VS-Locke VC Cross 300 EA |~ NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.25 $1.275.00 ~$6.15  $1,845.00 ‘No Bid ~ NoBid
" Street Sign Bracket; Glw0L90 Supr-Lok i i . NCIC R e e | R e e 1] i D S el T TR e N
76 v cap 100 EA No Bid NoBid| NoBid  NoBid $425  $425.00 $6.15 $615.00 No Bid 'No Bid
‘1} Roll Goods, White, High Intensity, | T e e P e L A e Ty VIR U e T S R R B R
Pressure Sensitive, 30" x 50 Yds 6 Boxes| _$600.00 . $3,600.0 00 ~ NoBid  NoBid $453.75 $2,722.50 $420.00 - $2,520.00 No Bid No Bid
Wﬁw ”Oﬂ‘ NMQOQm mwn.ﬂmllwme..mmﬁHN mnd.mu.ﬁ—d-\ﬂi B ‘ - i =G e L o =l AfEaa s e ;
®  Engineer Grade, 30" x 50 Yds 6  DBoxes ~ §281.25 $1,687.50 No Bid No Bid mwwo 00 $1,980.00 mwmw 21 $1, 615.26 No Bid No Bid
3‘ Roll Goods, Black, Pressure Sensitive, | e e R e — |- chebbobod BERU o bt 5 27 TR 2 L) 5 (e (L BOOION -.
Engineer Grade, 30" x 50 Yds 6. Boxes $300.00 $1,800.00|  No Bid NoBid| - $330.00  §$1,980.00| $261.76 = $1,570.56 No Bid No Bid
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